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From one of the world's best-known corporations comes this in-depth, inside story of how Accenture
revitalized its fabled corporate training organization in the midst of worldwide economic downturn and
major marketplace change. The company did so by focusing on the "return on learning": how Accenture's
investments in learning and knowledge management could be planned and managed to deliver measurable
business advantage.

Like most corporations at the turn of the millennium, Accenture was dealing with business, economic, and
operational changes that were profoundly affecting its internationally renowned internal training program,
which shapes and supports the work of its more than 126,000 employees in 48 countries. Within a few short
years, Accenture reinvented its training and development capabilities through effective planning and
governance, strong leadership, groundbreaking ROI methods, operational rigor, and the application of
advanced technologies, as well as what the company's learning team dubbed "phenomenal learning." The
result: better learning programs with measurably greater business impact at less cost.

The Accenture veterans who tell this story take readers deep inside Accenture's operations and decision
making, so other professionals and companies can benefit from these experiences in using training to achieve
high performance.

Donald Vanthournout is chief learning officer at Accenture. Kurt Olson, John Ceisel, Andrew White, Tad
Waddington, Thomas Barfield, Samir Desai, and Craig Mindrum are all with Accenture.
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From reader reviews:

Adam Nelson:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Return on Learning: Training for High Performance at Accenture. Try
to the actual book Return on Learning: Training for High Performance at Accenture as your close friend. It
means that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside associated with course make
you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you a lot more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with
this book.

Patrick Vanmeter:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Return on Learning: Training for High
Performance at Accenture reserve written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can
be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping
wet every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt Return
on Learning: Training for High Performance at Accenture as good book but not only by the cover but also
from the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing
one more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you
have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Beth Johnson:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-book
method, more simple and reachable. This specific Return on Learning: Training for High Performance at
Accenture can give you a lot of good friends because by you checking out this one book you have matter that
they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you
to get success. This book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more
than additional make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have Return on
Learning: Training for High Performance at Accenture.

Mary Lewis:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This particular book Return on Learning: Training for High
Performance at Accenture was vibrant and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Return on
Learning: Training for High Performance at Accenture has many kinds or style. Start from kids until teens.
For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore ,
not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best



book for you personally and try to like reading that.
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