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Online video is the powerful expressive tool that transforms the way we communicate. Journaling is
the time-proven practice that ignites creativity and inspires change. Naked Lens combines both and
offers an exciting new experience of video...and life. 

Are you ready?

Grab your mobile phone, camcorder, or whatever shoots video, and get ready to reclaim the YOU in
YouTube.

Naked Lens guides you through a unique eight-week work shop where you will learn how to:

Become comfortable on camera●

Develop presence...on camera and off●

Deeply connect to your audience●

Use video journaling to heal and change yourself and others●

Develop your authentic video voice and increase self-expression●

Use online video to enhance business and career growth●

Use camera framing and angles confidently and creatively●

Create your own authentic on-camera style●

Jump ahead of the online video revolution and become part of its evolution●
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From reader reviews:

Jim Martin:

The book Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim the You in Youtube can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a good thing like a book
Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim the You in Youtube? Wide variety you have a
different opinion about reserve. But one aim that will book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely
suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you can give for
each other; you could share all of these. Book Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim
the You in Youtube has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can
search the enormous world by open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Judy Brewer:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important usually. The book Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim
the You in Youtube ended up being making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take
more information. It is rather advantages for you. The publication Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video
Journaling to Reclaim the You in Youtube is not only giving you considerably more new information but
also to become your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your book.
Try to make relationship using the book Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim the
You in Youtube. You never experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

Jacqueline Morrison:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive
currently, people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded
place and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the
item for a while is reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to
stay than other is high. For you who want to start reading a book, we give you this Naked Lens: Video
Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim the You in Youtube book as starter and daily reading e-book. Why,
because this book is more than just a book.

Grace Smith:

Publication is one of source of information. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen have to have book to know the upgrade information of year to help year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world.
Through the book Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim the You in Youtube we can
have more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? For being creative person must like to read a
book. Only choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your



life with this book Naked Lens: Video Blogging & Video Journaling to Reclaim the You in Youtube. You
can more inviting than now.
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