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This is a volatile, unstable and hostile world. The Light and Darkness are on an equal footing as humanity
uncomfortably leaves the last Dark Age. God's creation, the world and all human souls are struck by harsh
energies on a regular basis. This is due to the dark side of humanity ruling with its uncontrollable and
disruptive ego. Author, Kevin Hunter, channels messages from the other side surrounding what Spirit has to
say about humanity and what this life is all about. Some of the many topics brought to light are Hell and the
Devil, the real monsters of society, the Ego, what happens to your spirit and soul when you die, the soul,
spirit and power of the light, humanity's destruction, mass hysteria, prayer, Jesus, abortion, race and
homosexuality. The Light's ultimate message in the end is what the entire spirit world is bathed in and that is
love.

This pocket book is part of a series of Warrior of Light books. Some of the content in all of the Warrior of
Light pocket books are available in three bigger books called, Warrior of Light: Messages from my Guides
and Angels, Empowering Spirit Wisdom, and Darkness of Ego.
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From reader reviews:

Howard Martinez:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Divine Messages for Humanity: Channeled
Communication from the Other Side on Death, the Afterlife, the Ego, Prejudices, Prayer and the Power of
Love. Try to make the book Divine Messages for Humanity: Channeled Communication from the Other Side
on Death, the Afterlife, the Ego, Prejudices, Prayer and the Power of Love as your good friend. It means that
it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever.
Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know
everything by the book. So , let us make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Christopher Helland:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person?
If you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer
that question because just their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes,
it is appropriate. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this specific Divine Messages for
Humanity: Channeled Communication from the Other Side on Death, the Afterlife, the Ego, Prejudices,
Prayer and the Power of Love to read.

Richard Hund:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Divine Messages for
Humanity: Channeled Communication from the Other Side on Death, the Afterlife, the Ego, Prejudices,
Prayer and the Power of Love which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Wanda Jacobsen:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in addition
native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year for you to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. With the book Divine Messages for Humanity: Channeled Communication from the Other Side on
Death, the Afterlife, the Ego, Prejudices, Prayer and the Power of Love we can get more advantage. Don't
one to be creative people? To become creative person must want to read a book. Just simply choose the best



book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life with that book Divine
Messages for Humanity: Channeled Communication from the Other Side on Death, the Afterlife, the Ego,
Prejudices, Prayer and the Power of Love. You can more desirable than now.
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