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"Deftly and intriguingly written. [A] thriller that fans of other novels such as 'The DaVinci Code' will relish.
Highly recommended."
John Taylor, Book Reviewer, Midwest Book Review

'What if...?' is a mainstream suspense thriller which blends intrigue and roller-coaster action into a fast-paced
tale that keeps you hooked to the very last page. Shootouts, car chases and conspiracies are interwoven with
a thought-provoking exploration of today's global crises, creating a chilling, real-life picture of the world and
a story that's as moving as it is thrilling.

The Mystery...

When a mysterious stranger appears to be healing New York City's sick merely through touch, a media
frenzy catapults him to superstar status.

When he then claims to be able to heal the entire world of hunger, injustice, and suffering just as easily as he
seems able to heal a sick child, thousands rally to his cause, desperate for a savior to snatch the world from
the edge of darkness.

But not everyone is eager to see the world changed.

Driven by their insatiable greed for money and power, corporate America, organized crime, even the mighty
White House will stop at nothing to ensure the world stays just the way it is - poverty, disease, wars and all!

The Hero...

A disillusioned journalist, Mary battles her skepticism and finally comes to believe in the stranger's gift.
Seeing him as mankind's last great hope for creating a utopia, she befriends him to try to realize the world
she's always dreamed of.

But will the world embrace a man who seems able to heal the sick with just a touch? Or will economic crises
or a holy war see it rip itself apart?

Mary quickly discovers that changing the world is not only difficult but downright deadly.

The Action...

Hurled into a raging storm of bullets, doubles crosses, car chases and conspiracies, Mary helps this enigmatic
stranger fight for his vision to become a reality. But what vision is that?

Can he truly heal?●

Does he really want to end suffering?●

Or, with immeasurable wealth the prize, is this the greatest confidence trick in history, masterminded to●

swindle billions from a world desperate for a savior to save it?



On a roller-coaster adventure crammed with mystery, shocking revelations, and pulse-pounding danger,
Mary realizes there's nowhere to hide from the fate that awaits them and which will shake the entire globe.

Dare you read 'What if...?'? - It'll tear your world apart.

***

'The writing, I must say, is excellent. John is an absolutely fascinating character and [I] particularly loved
those taut suspense scenes. Lee is great at creating tension. The action scenes are always fast-paced, dizzying
and fun.'
Nancy Horner, Book Reviewer, Bookfoolery and Babble
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From reader reviews:

Frances Oberlin:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave,
like looking for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled What If...?. Try to face the book What If...? as your good friend. It
means that it can to become your friend when you experience alone and beside those of course make you
smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you much more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , let me make new experience and knowledge with this
book.

Scott Anderson:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and
the resources inside it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals
to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this What If...? book as this book
offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred % guarantees there is no
doubt in it as you know.

Betsy Aguilar:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, typically the book
you have read is usually What If...?.

Irene Robertson:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social media.
You can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by means of
searching from it. It is named of book What If...?. Contain your knowledge by it. Without making the printed
book, it may add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most significant that, you must
aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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