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The debate between the theist and the atheist dates back millennia. Yet the crucial question involves not the
existence of deity, but what kind of deity might exist. Can we eliminate certain options and leave ourselves
free to explore others? In "Requiem for a Phantom God," author Stifyn Emrys argues that we can. Any
consideration of the divine should rule out what C.S. Lewis termed "nonsense." Self-contradictory portraits
of God are not only meaningless, but they have the potential to do great harm - and they have over the course
of human history. "Requiem for a Phantom God" serves as an epitaph for just such a god of nonsense. It
identifies the core philosophical problem: the desire of humanity to believe in an all-powerful deity who is
at, at the same time, entirely "good." This desire, however, is destined to remain unfulfilled, because these
two concepts simply cannot be reconciled. Once humanity realizes this, we can choose the kind of god we
wish to believe in: immanent or transcendent ... if, indeed, we wish to put our faith in a god at all. "Requiem"
discusses the abuses and pitfalls of faith, and whether it is possible to speak of a faith that is not blind. It
addresses modern and historical examples of religious abuse and suggests they tell us about the doctrines that
support them. Written in the tradition of Christopher Hitchens, "Requiem for a Phantom God" is in the
second publication this year from writer, educator and philosopher Stifyn Emrys. His previous book, "The
Gospel of the Phoenix: Another Revelation of Jesus," is also available.
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From reader reviews:

Russell Carson:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of various ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring that you imagine the
story how the characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other individuals. When you
read this Requiem for a Phantom God, you can tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours e-book.
Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a e-book.

Charles Davis:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get lots of
stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are you experiencing
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever try
this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, often the book you have
read is Requiem for a Phantom God.

Cecilia Moore:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but also novel and Requiem for a Phantom God or even others
sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel need to read
more and more. Science book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those ebooks are
helping them to put their knowledge. In some other case, beside science publication, any other book likes
Requiem for a Phantom God to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Nicholas Williams:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose typically the book Requiem for a Phantom God to make
your reading is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the impression about book and examining
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available a book and study it. Beside that the reserve
Requiem for a Phantom God can to be your new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in doing
what must you're doing of that time.
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