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Have you ever felt condemned by Christianity? Have you ever felt disconnected from Christianity’s God?
Have you ever felt terrified that a fiery and eternal hell awaits you if you don’t “believe the right thing”? If
you have ever felt that you have nothing in common with the early Israelites, a tribal people who slaughtered
millions of animals in order to “earn” God’s forgiveness, this book is for you. If you have ever felt that the
Spirit that whispers to your heart is more loving than the spirit that you see portrayed in your church, this
book is for you. If you have ever felt that there has to be more to spirituality than saying “the sinner’s
prayer” and regular church attendance, this book is for you. If you are attracted to the message of Jesus and
don’t see the loving simplicity of his teaching reflected in the church that you are going to, then perhaps
what your church is preaching is not what you are seeking. Perhaps what you are really looking for is an
introduction to the God that Jesus knew.

(This book has the same content as "The God Yeshua Knew", but refers to "Jesus" instead of "Yeshua".)
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Tucker:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specifically book entitled The
God Jesus Knew: And Christianity Forgot your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every single word
written in a book then become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get ahead of.
The The God Jesus Knew: And Christianity Forgot giving you yet another experience more than blown away
the mind but also giving you useful info for your better life with this era. So now let us demonstrate the
relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished reading it, like
winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Isaiah Owen:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you read
a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and
soon. The The God Jesus Knew: And Christianity Forgot provide you with new experience in looking at a
book.

Larry Valadez:

Beside this specific The God Jesus Knew: And Christianity Forgot in your phone, it may give you a way to
get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from
your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have
The God Jesus Knew: And Christianity Forgot because this book offers to you readable information. Do you
at times have book but you don't get what it's about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in the
hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want
to miss this? Find this book and also read it from currently!

David Fern:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This specific book The God Jesus Knew: And Christianity Forgot
was colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The God Jesus Knew: And
Christianity Forgot has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of
book are usually make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book
for you personally and try to like reading that will.
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