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Misty was just an ordinary cat--if any cat could be called ordinary. But after finding a "genie" in a bottle and
making a wish, he is forced to become human to rescue a child from Faerie. Being human isn't everything it's
cracked up to be. And making deals with the denizens of Faerie is a risky business in itself. "Nine Lives and
Three Wishes, by Jennifer St. Clair, is a fanciful tale filled with magic, adventure and love. Follow Misty,
Tib and Nia on a life-changing, life-affirming quest. It's a journey you'll thoroughly enjoy." Reviewed by
Gayle Trent, author, Laughing and Learning: Adventures in Parenting. "Nine Lives and Three Wishes is one
of the best fantasy books anyone could read. It has the perfect blend of fiction and realism, and you almost
believe it could really happen. Jennifer St. Clair paints such a clear picture of each character that you are left
with a lasting impression of the characters and the book itself. This story will keep you guessing what will
happen next right to up the end." Reviewed by Amanda Roberts for Romance Reviews Today.
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From reader reviews:

Kai Martin:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a book can
help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Nine Lives and Three Wishes book because
book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred percent guarantees there is
no doubt in it you may already know.

Neil McNatt:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Nine Lives and Three Wishes as the daily resource
information.

Janie Williams:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get lot of stress
from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely without a doubt.
People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you have when the spare
time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have read is
definitely Nine Lives and Three Wishes.

Mamie Contreras:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that need
more time to be study. Nine Lives and Three Wishes can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who
have those short free time problems.
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