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A Hindu monk in Calcutta refuses to take his psychotropic medications. His psychiatrist explains that just as
his body needs food, the drugs are nutrition for his starved mind. Does it matter how—or whether—patients
understand their prescribed drugs? 
 
Millions of people in India are routinely prescribed mood medications. Pharmaceutical companies give
doctors strong incentives to write as many prescriptions as possible, with as little awkward questioning from
patients as possible. Without a sustained public debate on psychopharmaceuticals in India, patients remain
puzzled by the notion that drugs can cure disturbances of the mind. While biomedical psychopharmaceuticals
are perceived with great suspicion, many non-biomedical treatments are embraced. 
 
Stefan Ecks illuminates how biomedical, Ayurvedic, and homeopathic treatments are used in India, and
argues that pharmaceutical pluralism changes popular ideas of what drugs do. Based on several years of
research on pharmaceutical markets, Ecks shows how doctors employ a wide range of strategies to make
patients take the remedies prescribed. Yet while metaphors such as "mind food" may succeed in getting
patients to accept the prescriptions, they also obscure a critical awareness of drug effects.
 
This rare ethnography of pharmaceuticals will be of key interest to those in the anthropology and sociology
of medicine, pharmacology, mental health, bioethics, global health, and South Asian studies.
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From reader reviews:

John Alfaro:

The publication untitled Eating Drugs: Psychopharmaceutical Pluralism in India (Biopolitics) is the e-book
that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to
anyone. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
article author was did a lot of investigation when write the book, so the information that they share to you is
absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Eating Drugs: Psychopharmaceutical Pluralism in
India (Biopolitics) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Micheal McDonough:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When
you go through a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds
of us novel, comics, and soon. The Eating Drugs: Psychopharmaceutical Pluralism in India (Biopolitics) will
give you a new experience in examining a book.

Kathy Graves:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This e-book Eating Drugs: Psychopharmaceutical Pluralism in India (Biopolitics)
was filled regarding science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading the book. If you know how big selling point of
a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book
you wanted.

Barbara McGowan:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book Eating Drugs: Psychopharmaceutical Pluralism in India
(Biopolitics) was colourful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Eating Drugs:
Psychopharmaceutical Pluralism in India (Biopolitics) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and believe that you are the
character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy,
fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading in which.
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