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If you had put $10,000 in Buffett's original investing partnership at its inception in 1956, you would have
collected about $293,738 by the time he dissolved it at the end of 1969. He had never suffered a down year,
even in the severe bear markets of 1957, 1962, 1966, and 1969. When the partnership was wound up, you
could have elected to stay with Buffett as a shareholder of Berkshire Hathaway, Inc., which was spun off
from the partnership and became Buffett's investing vehicle. In that event, your $10,000 would by the end of
1986 have turned into well over $5 million. So, John Train introduces the remarkable story of Warren Buffett
in his classic text, The Midas Touch. First published in 1987, The Midas Touch was one of the first books to
recognise Warren Buffett's spectacular record, and to attempt to explain how he achieved his success. It is
short, lucid and written with style and wit. A worthy testimony to its remarkable subject. From the back
cover of the book: This is the book that tells readers how to invest like the man known as 'the Wizard of
Omaha' (Forbes) and the investor with 'the Midas Touch' . Warren Buffett is the most successful investor
alive - the only member of the Forbes 400 to have earned his fortune entirely through investing. Bestselling
author John Train analyzes the strategies, based on the value approach, that have guided Buffett in his
remarkable career, strategies that work even though Buffett operates a thousand miles from Wall Street.
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From reader reviews:

Scott Ridgway:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content.
As you may know that book is very important for us. The book The Midas Touch (Harriman House Classics)
ended up being making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It
is very advantages for you. The publication The Midas Touch (Harriman House Classics) is not only giving
you a lot more new information but also to be your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your
own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship while using book The Midas
Touch (Harriman House Classics). You never sense lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Ian Coghlan:

Beside this particular The Midas Touch (Harriman House Classics) in your phone, it might give you a way to
get closer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh
through the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow town. It is good
thing to have The Midas Touch (Harriman House Classics) because this book offers for your requirements
readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you rarely get what it's exactly about. Oh come on,
that would not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, like
treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this? Find this book in addition to read it from right
now!

Judith Duncan:

You can obtain this The Midas Touch (Harriman House Classics) by browse the bookstore or Mall. Only
viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of
this e-book are various. Not only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the
modern era just like now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange
you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.

James Longo:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and The Midas Touch (Harriman
House Classics) as well as others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the good a
book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or students
especially. Those ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In different case, beside science guide,
any other book likes The Midas Touch (Harriman House Classics) to make your spare time far more
colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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