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Vincent van Gogh was an artist wholly saturated in the colors and contours of the landscapes in which he
lived and painted. More than Manet or Gauguin, nature itself was his muse and teacher: "it is not the
language of painters but the language of nature which one should listen to, the feeling for the things
themselves, for reality is more important than the feeling for pictures," he once avowed. Between Earth and
Heaven is the first book to provide a comprehensive survey of van Gogh's work as a landscape painter,
identifying the stylistic transitions that were specific to this aspect of his work. It shows how the earthy tones
of his early Dutch phase were gradually replaced by a lighter style following his relocation to Paris, and how,
in the south of France, the artist discovered the intense, brilliant colors and vital expression that have made
his paintings so fascinating to this day. Essays by renowned art historians and specialists explore this facet of
van Gogh's oeuvre, examining both the artist's blockbuster landscape works and lesser-known paintings.
Although he witnessed little success during his lifetime, today Vincent van Gogh (1853-1890) is rated as
one of the greatest Dutch painters in history. He produced the majority of his work--some 900 paintings and
1,100 drawings--during a brief span of ten years, before he succumbed to mental illness and committed
suicide at the age of 37. A seminal figure in the Post-Impressionist movement and an early pioneer of
Expressionism, van Gogh is today one of the world's most famous artists.
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From reader reviews:

Jill Barks:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Vincent van Gogh: Between Earth and Heaven: The Landscapes book is
readable simply by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the information here are arrange for
enjoyable looking at experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you.
The writer regarding Vincent van Gogh: Between Earth and Heaven: The Landscapes content conveys the
idea easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content
material but it just different in the form of it. So , do you still thinking Vincent van Gogh: Between Earth and
Heaven: The Landscapes is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Amanda Grant:

The actual book Vincent van Gogh: Between Earth and Heaven: The Landscapes will bring you to the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try to find
new book to read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Vincent van Gogh: Between Earth and
Heaven: The Landscapes is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book in the
official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Kristen Hancock:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is Vincent van Gogh: Between Earth and Heaven: The Landscapes this
publication consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This particular book was
represented so why is the world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book
suitable all of you.

Stephany Garcia:

Publication is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world.
With the book Vincent van Gogh: Between Earth and Heaven: The Landscapes we can get more advantage.
Don't you to definitely be creative people? For being creative person must love to read a book. Only choose
the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book Vincent van
Gogh: Between Earth and Heaven: The Landscapes. You can more attractive than now.
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