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An enlightened approach to pool design, The Swimming Pool matches superb aesthetics with the best of
today’s most innovative building materials for the ultimate guide to building your backyard retreat.
Renowned landscape designer Martha Baker explores four popular styles—Romantic, Modern, Classic, and
Rustic—and details the key elements that help to create a complete look. She provides ideas for
personalizing elements to match your individual taste and accommodating practical needs. Leading you on a
guided tour of exclusive international locales featuring pools with many different looks and styles, she offers
a wealth of advice on:

•Identifying the right design style to complement your property

•Siting your pool and selecting the best pool shape

•Creating poolside cooking and dining areas

•Choosing furniture that epitomizes the art of relaxation

•Landscaping to integrate your pool with your home and property

•Pinpointing the best accessories to pull it all together

Reminding us that pool design should be infused with a blend of fantasy and reality, Martha Baker features a
seductively elegant romantic pool that conjures the image of a Spanish courtyard; an infinity pool that takes
its cue from island traditions, perched on a hillside overlooking a tropical harbor; and a highly sophisticated
modern pool topped with playful, oversized sculptures. Authoritative and packed with more than 250
gorgeous photographs, The Swimming Pool opens up a world of unprecedented pool design.
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From reader reviews:

Marni Elliott:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is known to us
that book is very important for all of us. The book The Swimming Pool: Stylish and Inspirational Ideas for
Building and Decorating Your Pool was making you to know about other understanding and of course you
can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The guide The Swimming Pool: Stylish and
Inspirational Ideas for Building and Decorating Your Pool is not only giving you far more new information
but also to get your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read
your guide. Try to make relationship with all the book The Swimming Pool: Stylish and Inspirational Ideas
for Building and Decorating Your Pool. You never sense lose out for everything in the event you read some
books.

Victor Smith:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they will
get wide range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity
are there when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do
you try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the book you have
read is The Swimming Pool: Stylish and Inspirational Ideas for Building and Decorating Your Pool.

Lisa Haight:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This kind of The Swimming Pool: Stylish and Inspirational Ideas
for Building and Decorating Your Pool can give you a lot of good friends because by you taking a look at
this one book you have point that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This
book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that probably your friend
doesn't understand, by knowing more than various other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let
us have The Swimming Pool: Stylish and Inspirational Ideas for Building and Decorating Your Pool.

Lisa Keener:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when they get
a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book The Swimming Pool: Stylish and Inspirational Ideas
for Building and Decorating Your Pool to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading
talent is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you
just read it and mingle the sensation about book and examining especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to
like to start a book and study it. Beside that the book The Swimming Pool: Stylish and Inspirational Ideas for
Building and Decorating Your Pool can to be your brand new friend when you're experience alone and



confuse with what must you're doing of this time.
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