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Le Corbusier (1887-1965), the great Swiss-French architect, was unquestionably the most important figure in
twentieth-century architecture. His work in both design and theory has never been equaled. His most famous
buildings include Villa Savoye, Ronchamp Chapel, La Tourette, and Unité d'Habitation, and his manifesto,
Towards a New Architecture, is still read by all students of architecture worldwide.

This set of notebooks reveals the architect's early genius during his formative years. When he was a twenty-
three-year-old student traveling through Germany in 1910, he created a record of his journey in both words
and remarkable images. Sketching and writing in watercolor, charcoal, and colored pencil, he recorded
antique and contemporary architecture, his encounters with influential architects, and anything that crossed
his path that he deemed interesting. These sketchbooks are essential to understanding Le Corbusier's vision
and growth as an architect.

Published in a limited, numbered edition, the reproduction of the four notebooks is unparalleled. The pages
are exceptional facsimiles of the originals, to the point of showing charcoal smudges. The transcription in the
fifth volume is equally meticulous, with a clear system of notation to elucidate Le Corbusier's own shorthand
and even his crossed-out text. Giuliano Gresleri's comprehensive introduction discusses not only the
notebooks themselves but also their impact on Le Corbusier's life and future work.
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From reader reviews:

Danielle Rhodes:

In other case, little people like to read book Le Corbusier: Les Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5 Volume
Set). You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a
new book Le Corbusier: Les Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5 Volume Set). You can add expertise and of
course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can
realize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple
thing until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as
searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the
library. Let's go through.

Nyla Gomez:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for us. The book Le Corbusier: Les Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5
Volume Set) was making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It
is very advantages for you. The e-book Le Corbusier: Les Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5 Volume Set) is
not only giving you more new information but also to become your friend when you sense bored. You can
spend your current spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship while using book Le Corbusier:
Les Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5 Volume Set). You never experience lose out for everything when you
read some books.

Ronald Adams:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the subject Le Corbusier: Les
Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5 Volume Set) suitable to you? The particular book was written by popular
writer in this era. Often the book untitled Le Corbusier: Les Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5 Volume Set)is
the main one of several books which everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired a number of people
in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever know before. The author
explained their idea in the simple way, so all of people can easily to understand the core of this publication.
This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you see the represented
of the world on this book.

Nancy Sobel:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are there when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading guides. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, typically the book you have



read is Le Corbusier: Les Voyages d'Allemagne, Carnets (5 Volume Set).
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