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Renowned for its madrassas and archives of rare Arabic manuscripts, Timbuktu is famous as a great center
of Muslim learning from Islam’s Golden Age. Yet Timbuktu is not unique. It was one among many scholarly
centers to exist in precolonial West Africa. Beyond Timbuktu charts the rise of Muslim learning in West
Africa from the beginning of Islam to the present day, examining the shifting contexts that have influenced
the production and dissemination of Islamic knowledge?and shaped the sometimes conflicting interpretations
of Muslim intellectuals?over the course of centuries.

Highlighting the significant breadth and versatility of the Muslim intellectual tradition in sub-Saharan Africa,
Ousmane Kane corrects lingering misconceptions in both the West and the Middle East that Africa’s Muslim
heritage represents a minor thread in Islam’s larger tapestry. West African Muslims have never been isolated.
To the contrary, their connection with Muslims worldwide is robust and longstanding. The Sahara was not an
insuperable barrier but a bridge that allowed the Arabo-Berbers of the North to sustain relations with West
African Muslims through trade, diplomacy, and intellectual and spiritual exchange.

The West African tradition of Islamic learning has grown in tandem with the spread of Arabic literacy,
making Arabic the most widely spoken language in Africa today. In the postcolonial period, dramatic
transformations in West African education, together with the rise of media technologies and the ever-
evolving public roles of African Muslim intellectuals, continue to spread knowledge of Islam throughout the
continent.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Yohe:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will certainly
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you
don't know which one you should start with. This Beyond Timbuktu: An Intellectual History of Muslim
West Africa is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves
what you want and need in this era.

Nathaniel Marvel:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Beyond
Timbuktu: An Intellectual History of Muslim West Africa suitable to you? The particular book was written
by popular writer in this era. The actual book untitled Beyond Timbuktu: An Intellectual History of Muslim
West Africais the main of several books that will everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired many
men and women in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new way of measuring that you
ever know just before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, consequently all of people can
easily to know the core of this reserve. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world
now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this book.

David Moore:

This Beyond Timbuktu: An Intellectual History of Muslim West Africa is great e-book for you because the
content which is full of information for you who always deal with world and also have to make decision
every minute. That book reveal it data accurately using great plan word or we can claim no rambling
sentences within it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only
will give you straight forward sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences.
Having Beyond Timbuktu: An Intellectual History of Muslim West Africa in your hand like obtaining the
world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world
inside ten or fifteen moment right but this book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey
there Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt in which?

Jillian Harrington:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know
that little person similar to reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something by book. Many kinds
of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Beyond Timbuktu: An Intellectual



History of Muslim West Africa.
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