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"As familiar and widely appreciated works of modern technology, bridges are a good place to study the
relationship between the aesthetic and the technical. Fully engaged technical design is at once aesthetic and
structural. In the best work (the best design, the most well made), the look and feel of a device (its aesthetic,
perceptual interface) is as important a part of the design problem as its mechanism (the interface of parts and
systems). We have no idea how to make something that is merely efficient, a rational instrument blindly
indifferent to how it appears. No engineer can design such a thing and none has ever been built."?from
Artifice and Design

In an intriguing book about the aesthetics of technological objects and the relationship between technical and
artistic accomplishment, Barry Allen develops the philosophical implications of a series of interrelated
concepts?knowledge, artifact, design, tool, art, and technology?and uses them to explore parallel questions
about artistry in technology and technics in art. This may be seen at the heart of Artifice and Design in
Allen's discussion of seven bridges: he focuses at length on two New York bridges?the Hell Gate Bridge and
the Bayonne Bridge?and makes use of original sources for insight into the designers' ideas about the
aesthetic dimensions of their work. Allen starts from the conviction that art and technology must be treated
together, as two aspects of a common, technical human nature.

The topics covered in Artifice and Design are wide-ranging and interdisciplinary, drawing from evolutionary
biology, cognitive psychology, and the history and anthropology of art and technology. The book concludes
that it is a mistake to think of art as something subjective, or as an arbitrary social representation, and of
Technology as an instrumental form of purposive rationality. "By segregating art and technology," Allen
writes, "we divide ourselves against ourselves, casting up self-made obstacles to the ingenuity of art and
technology."
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From reader reviews:

Robert Stratton:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals
to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Artifice and Design: Art and
Technology in Human Experience book because book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the
data in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Martin Elkins:

You can spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Artifice and Design: Art and Technology
in Human Experience is simple to create you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train and soon. If
you did not have much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make
you simpler to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when you buy this book.

Susan Padgett:

Beside this specific Artifice and Design: Art and Technology in Human Experience in your phone, it can
give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are
going to got here is fresh in the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an outdated people live in
narrow town. It is good thing to have Artifice and Design: Art and Technology in Human Experience
because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you
would not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to
miss this? Find this book and also read it from now!

Leah Humphries:

A lot of publication has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by internet on social media.
You can choose the most effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching
from it. It is known as of book Artifice and Design: Art and Technology in Human Experience. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make a person
happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination
for a other place.
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