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The wrong secret can poison everything--even if it’s kept with the best of intentions.

Cost of Repairs, Book 3

Gavin Perez knows he’s a living cliché. He works a dead-end job, shares a trailer with his waitress mom, has
an abusive, absentee sperm donor, and he’s poor. So color him shocked when middle-class, white-bread Jace
Ramsey agrees to hang out with him.

Granted, Gavin is trying to make up for dumping a bowl of cranberry sauce on Jace at Thanksgiving. And
boy, is Gavin forgiven, over and over again…until Jace goes back to college for finals and stops returning
Gavin’s calls.

Back home from the semester from hell, Jace doesn’t want to do anything but sleep through the holidays. It’s
easier than coming out to his family—or facing Gavin’s hurt. But Gavin’s ready forgiveness draws them
back together, and Jace won’t be able to stay in the closet much longer.

Nor will he be able to keep hiding his pain. He trusts Gavin with his body, maybe even with his heart. But
can he trust that a devastating secret that’s eating him up inside won’t destroy everything—and
everyone—he loves?

Warning: This book contains one slightly hyperactive hero from the wrong side of town, a frustrated college
student looking for a little life experience, and an unexpected romance amid dark secrets that just won’t stay
buried. Also contains references to physical abuse some readers may find disturbing.
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From reader reviews:

Dolores Watkins:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is actually reading a book. Why not the person who
don't like studying a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or
maybe exercise. Well, probably you will need this Weight of Silence (Cost of Repairs Book 3).

Susan Williams:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all
people in the world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something
that they don't want do that. You must know how great and important the book Weight of Silence (Cost of
Repairs Book 3). All type of book could you see on many options. You can look for the internet sources or
other social media.

Clifford Caldwell:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet
and the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more
to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Weight of Silence (Cost
of Repairs Book 3) book because book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in
this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

James Stevens:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also become a life style. This
reading addiction give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get
based on what kind of publication you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but
if you want really feel happy read one with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual Weight
of Silence (Cost of Repairs Book 3) is kind of publication which is giving the reader unstable experience.
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