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Adeline Curtis lands an internship with the mysterious and powerful Jon Banks. Night and day, Addie
struggles to fulfill his overwhelming demands.

But when the innocent intern discovers a naughty bondage video on her boss’s office computer, Addie can
hardly believe what she’s seeing: beautiful young women being tied and teased by older men.

She realizes that Mr. Banks is hellbent on teaching his seductive intern the rules of love and submission.

When Addie’s ordered by her dominating boss to accompany him on a business trip, she suspects that he has
more in mind for her sexy young body than he’ll admit. Mr. Banks introduces Addie to strange new
pleasures...all designed to tie her closer to him.

But when she discovers the devastating secret behind why she landed the coveted internship in the first
place, she’s faced with an impossible choice.

Torn between her family and the man she loves, will Addie stay with the man she’s been trained to obey?
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From reader reviews:

Donald Davisson:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want really feel happy read
one with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the At His Pleasure: Addie Learns the
Ropes is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Chung England:

The guide untitled At His Pleasure: Addie Learns the Ropes is the book that recommended to you to study.
You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you. The language that publisher use
to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of research when write the
book, to ensure the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book
of At His Pleasure: Addie Learns the Ropes from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Kimberley Bailey:

The publication with title At His Pleasure: Addie Learns the Ropes contains a lot of information that you can
find out it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This book exist new information the information
that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to learn
how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you with new era of the glowbal growth. You can
read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Dwight Roberts:

Some individuals said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a guide. They are directly felt it when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book At His Pleasure: Addie Learns the Ropes
to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is developing when you just like
reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the impression about book
and reading through especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open a book and study it. Beside that
the guide At His Pleasure: Addie Learns the Ropes can to be your brand-new friend when you're feel alone
and confuse in doing what must you're doing of these time.
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