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He'll make her a bet she can't refuse...

Lily McIntire is in the creepiest mansion in town. Alone. At night. Because she's an idiot-and can't ignore a
dare from her cocky and infuriatingly hot co-worker, Marcus Black. But she'll be damned if she's going to
give him the satisfaction of winning.

Marcus has had a thing for Lily for ages, and he has no intention of losing this bet. His plan? Scare her out of
the house, and into his arms. Once there, scaring her turns into protecting her and soon after, into seducing
her. And his plan is working...

Lily is having trouble relegating Marcus to the role of "asshat" as easily as before. He came to her rescue,
and he's actually funny. Charming. Sexy as sin on a stick. But Lily has a strict no-love-in-the-workplace rule,
and even one night of the best sex ever won't make her change her mind. So she's calling everything off...

Surviving a night in the mansion might just be the easy part. Surviving Marcus's increasingly convincing
advances is going to take everything she has. Losing is not an option...

NOTE: This title was previously published November 2013 on Flaunt as a novella but has been
significantly revised and lots of yummy new scenes added to give readers a full-length category
romance full of humor and sizzle.
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From reader reviews:

William Martin:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This If You Dare book is readable by simply you who hate those perfect
word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving even
decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer of If You Dare content conveys the idea
easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just
different as it. So , do you continue to thinking If You Dare is not loveable to be your top record reading
book?

Alfonso Miller:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, going to beach,
or picnic from the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Will you something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book is usually option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try
look for book, may be the reserve untitled If You Dare can be excellent book to read. May be it could be best
activity to you.

Otis Kozlowski:

If You Dare can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away
because this publication has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to
understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get
every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing If You Dare however doesn't forget the main stage,
giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one among it.
This great information can certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial imagining.

Andrea Whitt:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an effort
to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its protect may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer might be If You Dare why because the amazing cover that make you
consider regarding the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is fantastic as the
outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.
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