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From the world’s most repressive state comes rare good news: the escape to freedom of a small number of its
people. It is a crime to leave North Korea. Yet increasing numbers of North Koreans dare to flee. They go
first to neighboring China, which rejects them as criminals, then on to Southeast Asia or Mongolia, and
finally to South Korea, the United States, and other free countries. They travel along a secret route known as
the new underground railroad.

With a journalist’s grasp of events and a novelist’s ear for narrative, Melanie Kirkpatrick tells the story of the
North Koreans’ quest for liberty. Travelers on the new underground railroad include women bound to
Chinese men who purchased them as brides, defectors carrying state secrets, and POWs from the Korean
War held captive in the North for more than half a century. Their conductors are brokers who are in it for the
money as well as Christians who are in it to serve God. The Christians see their mission as the liberation of
North Korea one person at a time.

Just as escaped slaves from the American South educated Americans about the evils of slavery, the North
Korean fugitives are informing the world about the secretive country they fled. Escape from North Korea
describes how they also are sowing the seeds for change within North Korea itself. Once they reach
sanctuary, the escapees channel news back to those they left behind. In doing so, they are helping to open
their information-starved homeland, exposing their countrymen to liberal ideas, and laying the intellectual
groundwork for the transformation of the totalitarian regime that keeps their fellow citizens in chains.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Christensen:

The actual book Escape from North Korea: The Untold Story of Asia's Underground Railroad will bring one
to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you
try to find new book to learn, this book very suitable to you. The book Escape from North Korea: The Untold
Story of Asia's Underground Railroad is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book
from the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

John Jacquez:

The guide with title Escape from North Korea: The Untold Story of Asia's Underground Railroad has lot of
information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular book
exist new understanding the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world right
now. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you
within new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the
item anywhere you want.

Susan Scott:

You may spend your free time to study this book this book. This Escape from North Korea: The Untold
Story of Asia's Underground Railroad is simple bringing you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train
and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy typically
the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Patricia Watts:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Escape from North Korea: The Untold Story
of Asia's Underground Railroad was colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that
book Escape from North Korea: The Untold Story of Asia's Underground Railroad has many kinds or type.
Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and think you are
the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it makes you feel
happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.
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