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If there is one film in the canon of Carl Theodor Dreyer that can be said to be, as Jacques Lacan might put it,
his most “painfully enjoyable,” it is Gertrud. The film's Paris premier in 1964 was covered by the Danish
press as a national scandal; it was lambasted on its release for its lugubrious pace, wooden acting, and old-
fashioned, stuffy milieu. Only later, when a younger generation of critics came to its defense, did the method
in what appeared to be Dreyer's madness begin to become apparent.

To make vivid just what was at stake for Dreyer, and still for us, in his final work, James Schamus focuses
on a single moment in the film. He follows a trail of references and allusions back through a number of
thinkers and artists (Boccaccio, Lessing, Philostratus, Charcot, and others) to reveal the richness and depth of
Dreyer's work--and the excitement that can accompany cinema studies when it opens itself up to other
disciplines and media. Throughout, Schamus pays particular attention to Dreyer's lifelong obsession with the
“real,” developed through his practice of “textual realism,” a realism grounded not in standard codes of
verisimilitude but on the force of its rhetorical appeal to its written, documentary sources.

As do so many of the heroines of Dreyer's other films, such as La Passion de Jeanne d'Arc (1928), Gertrud
serves as a locus for Dreyer's twin fixations; written texts, and the heroines who both embody and free
themselves from them. Dreyer based Gertrud not only on Hjalmar Soderberg's play of 1906, but also on his
own extensive research into the life of the “real” Gertrud, Maria van Platen, whose own words Dreyer
interpolated into the film. By using his film as a kind of return to the real woman beneath the text, Dreyer
rehearsed another lifelong journey, back to the poor Swedish girl who gave birth to him out of wedlock and
who gave him up for adoption to a Danish family, a mother whose existence Dreyer only discovered later in
life, long after she had died.
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From reader reviews:

Victor Elam:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. These are reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Carl Theodor Dreyer's Gertrud: The Moving Word (McLellan Books).

David Briggs:

Do you among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys that
aren't like that. This Carl Theodor Dreyer's Gertrud: The Moving Word (McLellan Books) book is readable
by simply you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
reading through experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The
writer involving Carl Theodor Dreyer's Gertrud: The Moving Word (McLellan Books) content conveys
prospect easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content
but it just different as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Carl Theodor Dreyer's Gertrud: The Moving Word
(McLellan Books) is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Mamie Bostic:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get
a lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can
certainly share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all
their reader with their story as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the publications. But
also they write about advantage about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth
always try to improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to the
book. One of them is this Carl Theodor Dreyer's Gertrud: The Moving Word (McLellan Books).

Kenneth Jordan:

The book with title Carl Theodor Dreyer's Gertrud: The Moving Word (McLellan Books) has a lot of
information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. That book exist new
expertise the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world right now. That is
important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you throughout
new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you
want.
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