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Today the world is facing the dangers of Ebola Virus but it is not the first killer disease to originate in Africa.
In 1969 the Lassa fever began ravaging the same areas of Africa with much the same symptoms and
deadliness as Ebola. Lassa came out of the African bush country and spread terror throughout the Nigerian
Highlands. Its first known victim was a nurse at a lonely mission hospital. She had been cared for by two
other nurses both of whom fell ill. One died, the other was flown to Columbia Presbyterian Hospital in New
York for emergency treatment. It was the beginning of one of the most dramatic detective stories in modern
medical science. To identify the pestilence, find its carrier, and produce a cure, neurologists began working
around the clock. But even scientists in their supposedly germ-proof laboratories weren't safe. The virus
struck down workers in the Yale University lab. Research was halted, then transferred to Atlanta, Georgia,
where it could be conducted in the newly built maximum security moon research facilities. Meanwhile, the
disease was radiating across Africa, where thousands of people faced horrifying deaths if a cure could not be
found. Ebola is presenting the world with the same sort of devastating danger today.
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From reader reviews:

Tony Edwin:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to imagine the
story how the figures do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to others. When you read this
The Hunt for a New Killer Virus, it is possible to tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours
reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a reserve.

Julie Gailey:

The e-book with title The Hunt for a New Killer Virus has lot of information that you can understand it. You
can get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new expertise the information that exist in
this book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to understand how
the improvement of the world. That book will bring you throughout new era of the internationalization. You
can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Debra Lovern:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read
you can spent the entire day to reading a e-book. The book The Hunt for a New Killer Virus it is very good
to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore
simply to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high
quality.

Melvin Hayes:

Reserve is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we
know those guides have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to
around the world. By the book The Hunt for a New Killer Virus we can get more advantage. Don't that you
be creative people? To get creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life by this book The Hunt for a New
Killer Virus. You can more attractive than now.
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