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In her eagerly awaited new novel, beloved New York Times best-selling author Emily Giffin returns with an
extraordinary story of love and loyalty - and an unconventional heroine struggling to reconcile both.

Thirty-three-year-old Shea Rigsby has spent her entire life in Walker, Texas - a small college town that lives
and dies by football, a passion she unabashedly shares. Raised alongside her best friend, Lucy, the daughter
of Walker's legendary head coach, Clive Carr, Shea was too devoted to her hometown team to leave. Instead
she stayed in Walker for college, even taking a job in the university athletic department after graduation,
where she has remained for more than a decade.

But when an unexpected tragedy strikes the tight-knit Walker community, Shea's comfortable world is
upended, and she begins to wonder if the life she's chosen is really enough for her. As she finally gives up
her safety net to set out on an unexpected path, Shea discovers unsettling truths about the people and things
she has always trusted most - and is forced to confront her deepest desires, fears, and secrets.

Thoughtful, funny, and brilliantly observed, The One & Only is a luminous novel about finding your passion,
following your heart, and, most of all, believing in something bigger than yourself...the one and only thing
that truly makes life worth living.
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From reader reviews:

Amy Dixon:

This The One & Only: A Novel book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you obtain by reading this book is usually information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will
get data which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This specific The One & Only: A
Novel without we know teach the one who reading through it become critical in pondering and analyzing.
Don't always be worry The One & Only: A Novel can bring when you are and not make your case space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This The
One & Only: A Novel having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not feel uninterested in
reading.

Edward Salls:

The actual book The One & Only: A Novel will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading some
sort of book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to learn,
this book very acceptable to you. The book The One & Only: A Novel is much recommended to you you just
read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Pearl McLean:

The guide with title The One & Only: A Novel has a lot of information that you can understand it. You can
get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist in this
publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to understand how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the internationalization. You can read
the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Irene Justice:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking The One & Only: A Novel that
give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the
world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world considerably better then how they react to the
world. It can't be stated constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who
wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to start studying as your good habit, you could
pick The One & Only: A Novel become your own personal starter.
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