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Vengeance, sacrifice, compassion and the art of war. Adventure beyond fear.

Long lost keeper of the keys and unfit first daughter, Kyrin Cieri is the hope of Cierheld stronghold or its
doom.

She returns to Britannia from slavery, and ambitious lords and the intrigue she thought she left behind in
Araby engulf her stronghold. The king dies and treachery wounds her father.

Torn by love, loyalty, and intrigue between a lord’s son she’s sworn never to handfast, her father's life, a
rival stronghold daughter, and the wazir’s vengeance, Kyrin must find the strength to become who she was
born to be or all will end in ash.

Behind them all lurks the tiger of destruction. The falcon dagger holds the key to life, death, and a traitor
deeper yet.

In Falcon Flight Shannon Hale's Book of a Thousand Days meets Lisa T. Bergrin's A River of Time series in
an epic teen and young adult fantasy adventure series.

Book Excerpt:

A belligerent horn blared. Keffer’s men ran from the gate. And it was as if the world ended. A thunderous
noise and a slap as of a giant hand hurled against the gate knocked Kyrin sprawling on a blast of air and
shards of wood. She rolled over in the mud.

The gate creaked open thirty paces away, buckled and splintered, within a bitter stink and another cloud of
dark smoke. Her vision blurred in and out, and she hardly heard Lord Nidfael Keffer’s men give a single
shout as they moved back again.

And Lord Keffer rode through the inner gate on a white horse, twin to Mornoth’s. It paced past Kyrin toward
the hall, so close she could have touched Nidfael’s sweat-stained leather stirrup. Her breath froze in her
chest; she couldn’t move.

Wherever her blurred gaze fell, Cierheldens were being disarmed. Her men had gone, dead or fled the
sorcerous blast. Sorcery—or—Tae had said something of a strange black powder of enormous power when
joined by flame in a contained space. The men of the East held keen wit for inventions of death. And
Mornoth used it against them . . .

Kyrin staggered and sank to her knees in the thawing mud, suddenly conscious she was holding herself up by
her sword, point first in the earth. Around her, Nidfael’s men lifted their blades warily. One man tilted a pike
toward her. Could they know who she was?



Before Cierheld hall, Lord Keffer’s mailed back was straight. A polearm guard of six bristled around him.
The gates were packed with men bearing the white horse-head. Kyrin looked at her sword, and let it fall.

Cierheld was lost. There was no escape. She sagged over her knees, too sick to cry, and her bow dug into her
shoulder, the tip on the ground bending dangerously. She could save that. Kyrin laid her bow on the ground
with shaking hands and slid her quiver over her head, lowering it to the earth. A weapon cared for was a later
friend. . . .

Kyrin tilted her head; Lord Nidfael’s men watched him implore and demand by turns. These were her
people. She was not what she wished, but better her than no one. Tae also said, Never give up. Kyrin slid an
arrow from her quiver, the edges of her vision greying on Lord Keffer.

Steeling herself against a blade or an arrow in the back, she stood slowly, leaning on her bow, one arm limp
at her side. The same shoulder her mail had plagued earlier. She did not feel it now.

“Do not be foolish, this is the last grace I will give,” Lord Keffer cried. “Surely, you cannot all be fools?”
His blue tunic was bright.

Together we cry, full to the wide blue sky. Rise over stone, for hope to vie. Spread wings where freedoms lie.

His closest man was ten paces away. Kyrin quietly nocked the arrow. The arrow her father had given her.
Though it was not red but black. May you fly true. Scent of sweat and blood and bruised grass hung in the air
with the bitter smoke. She raised the bow—and loosed.

Crossover: Find the Eternal, the Adventure
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Major:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Studying
a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Falcon Flight:
Chronicle II (an epic YA fantasy adventure in medieval times) book because book offers you rich
information and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as
you know.

Marsha Gleason:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok
you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Falcon Flight: Chronicle II
(an epic YA fantasy adventure in medieval times) which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's see.

Karen Rodriguez:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Falcon Flight: Chronicle II (an epic YA fantasy
adventure in medieval times) was bright colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book
Falcon Flight: Chronicle II (an epic YA fantasy adventure in medieval times) has many kinds or type. Start
from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and feel that you are
the character on there. So , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy,
fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading this.

Justin Mireles:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book Falcon Flight: Chronicle II (an epic YA
fantasy adventure in medieval times) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of
reading skill is developing when you like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to
see it and mingle the feeling about book and reading especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to
wide open a book and read it. Beside that the book Falcon Flight: Chronicle II (an epic YA fantasy adventure
in medieval times) can to be your new friend when you're feel alone and confuse using what must you're
doing of the time.
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