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The Letting Go Trilogies: Stories of a Mixed-Race Family traces four decades of what it means to be a
mixed-race adult who sometimes called herself “Secret Asian Woman.”

With her personal essays written over a ten-year period, Dmae Roberts journeys through biracial identity,
Taiwan, sci-fi, and the trials of her interracial Taiwanese and Oklahoman family amid love, loss and letting
go of past regrets and pain.

Through journeys across America, Japan and Taiwan, this collection of personal stories charts four decades
of racial identity. Each essay lends insights into the complexity of cross-cultural family relationships and
includes photographs of the author's family.

Edited by Jessica Morrell. Additional editor and copy-editing by Sandra de Helen. Artwork and cover design
by Kathy Delumpa Allegri.

Praise for The Letting Go Trilogies:

“These bravely and beautifully written essays tell the story of an artist’s coming-of-age and a daughter
coming to terms with her grief. This impassioned collection is all guts and heart and ultimately grace.”

—Heidi W. Durrow, New York Times best-selling author of The Girl Who Fell From the Sky (Algonquin
Books)

“When you’re the living, breathing, confluence of two cultures, your search for self-identity is perpetual.
These profound essays are a medley on what it’s like to live on that seismic fault line. This book spoke to my
heart.”

—Jamie Ford, New York Times best-selling author of Hotel on the Corner of Bitter and Sweet and Songs of
Willow Frost (Ballantine Books)

“The magnet does not grow weary, and family ties still tug, even when we have to let go if we are to live our
singular lives. Your own search for how to find balance between family devotion and the oxygen required
for independence will find insight in these essays by Dmae Roberts— essays born of long thinking by a
gifted writer who has turned her power to document the lives of others to her own deep story.”

—Kim Stafford, author of 100 Tricks Every Boy Can Do: How My Brother Disappeared (Trinity University
Press)
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From reader reviews:

Fernando Rowe:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on
what kind of publication you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you
want sense happy read one using theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual The Letting
Go Trilogies: Stories of a Mixed-Race Family is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable
experience.

Donna Hubbard:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept The Letting Go
Trilogies: Stories of a Mixed-Race Family suitable to you? The particular book was written by renowned
writer in this era. The book untitled The Letting Go Trilogies: Stories of a Mixed-Race Familyis one of
several books in which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many people in the world.
When you read this publication you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know previous to. The
author explained their idea in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to know the core of this
reserve. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world on this book.

Robert Poulin:

Reading a book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write
about advantage about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some research before they write on their book. One of them
is this The Letting Go Trilogies: Stories of a Mixed-Race Family.

Karen Lambert:

This The Letting Go Trilogies: Stories of a Mixed-Race Family is fresh way for you who has interest to look
for some information since it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having little bit of digest in reading this The Letting Go
Trilogies: Stories of a Mixed-Race Family can be the light food in your case because the information inside
this particular book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books create itself in the form which can be
reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in publication form make them



feel drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is no in reading a guide especially this one. You
can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book type
for your better life as well as knowledge.
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