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St. Clare is a much-loved figure in Catholic sainthood, although less known than St. Francis of Assisi. These
two figures were critical to the renewal of the Church in their time, and their work has implications far down
the ages, to our present time.

St. Clare: A Short Biography looks at the founder of the Order of the Poor Ladies (now the Order of Saint
Clare, commonly referred to as the Poor Clares), a monastic religious order for women in the Franciscan
tradition. It considers the woman who heard and chose to follow Francis rather than marrying a young and
wealthy man as her parents wanted, who moved to the church of San Damiano and then drew other women
to a place known for its radically austere lifestyle. Most of all, the book reflects her theology of joyous
poverty in imitation of Christ, and her willingness to follow the call of Christ.

This is an introductory portrait of St. Clare beyond the common perceptions, with the spirit of Franciscan
practice implicit throughout the work. St. Clare: A Short Biography highlights the relevance of this pivotal
saint to our lives here and now.
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From reader reviews:

Lauren Marine:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people
in the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great along with important the book St. Clare: A Short
Biography. All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Candy Yazzie:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each data they get. How many people to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Examining a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this St. Clare: A Short Biography book
because this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Maria Smith:

This St. Clare: A Short Biography are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The key
reason why of this St. Clare: A Short Biography can be one of many great books you must have is definitely
giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed anyone with information that might be will shock
your before knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your
conditions throughout the e-book and printed ones. Beside that this St. Clare: A Short Biography giving you
an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we realize it useful
in your day exercise. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Angela Smith:

The actual book St. Clare: A Short Biography will bring you to the new experience of reading any book. The
author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to see, this book very
suitable to you. The book St. Clare: A Short Biography is much recommended to you to study. You can also
get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.
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