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If you’ve never had friends, you’ve never really lived

Geet, one of the most unpopular girls in college, is best friends with the beautiful and sought-after Shibani.
To win the popularity vote, Geet takes the help of college hottie Rudra, who agrees to act as her
‘boyfriend’—he sees an opportunity to get closer to Shibani. Little does he know that Shibani has been
harbouring feelings for someone else all along.

As misunderstandings and jealousies take centre stage, Geet must make a decision that will affect not just her
own life, but also those of her loved ones.

She Swiped Right into My Heart is a story about love—gained and lost—and the healing power of
friendship.
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From reader reviews:

Roger Borquez:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or data even knowledge to make
them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to anyone is you don't
know what one you should start with. This She Swiped Right Into My Heart is our recommendation to make
you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Marlene Clabaugh:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole day
to reading a publication. The book She Swiped Right Into My Heart it is rather good to read. There are a lot
of those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did
not have enough space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read
this book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers high quality.

William Leone:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book She Swiped Right Into My Heart was colourful and of
course has pictures on the website. As we know that book She Swiped Right Into My Heart has many kinds
or genre. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think
that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers up
you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading in which.

Thomas White:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is called of book She
Swiped Right Into My Heart. You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it can
add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about
publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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