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In the summer of 1881, Robert Justus Kleberg rode across the hot, dusty South Texas brush country to the
palatial home of Capt. Richard King to consult with the cattle baron about attending to his legal affairs. On
that same journey, the young lawyer also first laid eyes on Alice King, “Princess of the Wild Horse Desert.”
Neither of their lives would ever be the same.

Published for the first time in this book, the love letters written by Kleberg to Alice Gertrudis King provide a
glimpse of the lives of two of the most influential people in Texas history. Editors Jane Clements Monday
and Frances Brannen Vick have also provided generous documentation and annotation of these important
primary documents from the Special Collections at Texas A&M University–Corpus Christi, affording
historians and interested readers an insider’s view of one of the world’s greatest ranching empires as it
transitioned from its founders to the next generation.

Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King-Ranch Dynasty represents the only existing collection of letters
between any of the great Texas cattle barons and their wives. Although a great deal is already known about
the ranch and its development, Monday and Vick present for the first time Robert Justus Kleberg’s personal
perspective on his first meeting with Alice King, their early courtship, the difficulties obtaining her parents’
permission to marry, and the poignant time surrounding Captain King’s death.
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From reader reviews:

Carmen Jensen:

This Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf Coast Books, sponsored by Texas
A&M University-Corpus Christi) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is usually information inside this guide incredible fresh,
you will get details which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. That Letters to
Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf Coast Books, sponsored by Texas A&M University-
Corpus Christi) without we recognize teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and
analyzing. Don't end up being worry Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf Coast
Books, sponsored by Texas A&M University-Corpus Christi) can bring any time you are and not make your
carrier space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even
cellphone. This Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf Coast Books, sponsored by
Texas A&M University-Corpus Christi) having great arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Traci Farris:

Do you one among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf Coast Books,
sponsored by Texas A&M University-Corpus Christi) book is readable by means of you who hate the
straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without
leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer regarding Letters to Alice:
Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf Coast Books, sponsored by Texas A&M University-Corpus
Christi) content conveys objective easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not
different in the content material but it just different as it. So , do you still thinking Letters to Alice: Birth of
the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf Coast Books, sponsored by Texas A&M University-Corpus Christi)
is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Robert Defazio:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
even playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole
day to reading a publication. The book Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf
Coast Books, sponsored by Texas A&M University-Corpus Christi) it is rather good to read. There are a lot
of folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have
enough space bringing this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book out of
your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book provides high quality.



Louise Suttle:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This book Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch
Dynasty (Gulf Coast Books, sponsored by Texas A&M University-Corpus Christi) was vibrant and of course
has pictures around. As we know that book Letters to Alice: Birth of the Kleberg-King Ranch Dynasty (Gulf
Coast Books, sponsored by Texas A&M University-Corpus Christi) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids
until teens. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character
on there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun
and rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading in which.
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