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Determinants of economic growth: An overview Thijs de Ruyter van Steveninck, Nico van der Windt, and
Maaike Oosterbaan Netherlands Economic Institute What causes economic growth? Why have some
countries grown much faster than others? Why do some countries not grow at all, or even experience
negative (per capita) growth rates? What can governments do to raise the growth rates of their country?
These questions were discussed at a conference on March 23 and 24, 1998, organized by the Netherlands
Economic Institute (NEI) on behalf of the Netherlands Ministry of Foreign Affairs. This book contains the
proceedings of the conference. Economic growth is widely considered as a necessary (though not sufficient)
condition for poverty alleviation. During the past two decades, scholars and researchers have found a
renewed interest in thinking about economic growth, and advances in the understanding of economic growth
have taken place. On the one hand, the theoretical understanding of growth has progressed on various fronts,
including endogenous technological innovation and increasing returns to scale; the interaction of population,
fertility, human capital, and growth; international spill-overs in technology and capital accumulation; and the
role of institutions. On the other hand, the increasing availability and use of data sets has given a large
incentive to empirical research on cross-country growth, following the path-breaking work ofBarro (1991).
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From reader reviews:

Angela Gagne:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or
their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic from the park.
They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your current
free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book may be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try look for book, may be
the guide untitled The Determinants of Economic Growth can be good book to read. May be it is usually best
activity to you.

Maria Kraus:

The Determinants of Economic Growth can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The writer
giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing The Determinants of Economic
Growth although doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm
resource facts that maybe you can be among it. This great information can drawn you into fresh stage of
crucial imagining.

Myrtle Brown:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared with can
satisfy your short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find publication that
need more time to be study. The Determinants of Economic Growth can be your answer as it can be read by
you who have those short time problems.

Lisa Langlais:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
read a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and
soon. The The Determinants of Economic Growth will give you a new experience in looking at a book.
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